Scott County Board of Supervisors
November 21, 2024 5:00 p.m.

The Board of Supervisors met pursuant to adjournment with Paustian, Bribriesco,
Beck, Dickson and Maxwell present. The Board recited the Pledge of Allegiance.

Moved by Paustian, seconded by Bribriesco a motion approving the minutes of
the November 5, 2024 Committee of the Whole, the November 7, 2024 Board Meeting
and the November 13, 2024 Canvass of Votes. Roll Call: Four Ayes with Bribriesco
abstaining.

Moved by Paustian, seconded by Bribriesco at 5:02 p.m. a motion to close the
meeting to discuss pending litigation pursuant to lowa Code Section 21.5(1)(c). Roll
Call: All Ayes.

Moved by Paustian, seconded by Bribriesco at 5:31 p.m. a motion to reconvene
in open session. Roll Call: All Ayes.

Moved by Paustian, seconded by Bribriesco a motion to open a public hearing on
setting the date for the 2024 County Tax Deed Online Auction to open at 12:00PM on
Wednesday, November 27, 2024 and close at 11:59AM on Friday, December 20, 2024
with a minimum bid of $100. Roll Call: All Ayes.

No one from the public addressed the Board.

Moved by Paustian, seconded by Bribriesco a motion to close the public hearing.
Roll Call: All Ayes.

Moved by Paustian, seconded by Bribriesco that the following twelve consent
agenda items be approved. Roll Call: All Ayes.

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) That the contract for PCC Pavement — Replacement Project No.
L-824--73-82 (North Brady St, 210th St, Holden Dr, 214th St and 215th St in
unincorporated Mt. Joy) be awarded to Hawkeye Paving Corporation contingent on the
unit prices listed in the contract. 2) That the Chairperson be authorized to sign the
contract documents on behalf of the Board. 3) That this resolution shall take effect
immediately. (254-2024)

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED: 1) The Board of Supervisors of Scott County in
accordance with the LRSP, Scott County will continue to take the necessary steps to
improve safety on the county’s roadways in order to realize our goal of zero roadway
fatalities and serious injuries by 2050. (255-2024)

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) As the local governing body responsible for the approval of
subdivision plats within its rural jurisdiction, the Scott County Board of Supervisors has
on this 21st day of November, 2024, considered the final plat of Legacy Farm 2nd
Subdivision. Said plat is a subdivision in Part of the S V2 of the SW V4 of Section 27 of
Butler Township in Scott County, lowa, and having found the same made in substantial



accordance with the provisions of Chapter 354, Code of lowa, and the Scott County
Subdivision Ordinance, does hereby approve the final plat of said subdivision. 2) The
Board Chairman is authorized to sign the Certificate of Approval on behalf of the Board
of Supervisors and the County Auditor to attest to his signature. 3) This Resolution shall
take effect upon confirmation from the Planning and Development Director to the
Chairman of the Board of Supervisors that the three conditions of approval
recommended by the Planning and Zoning Commission have been satisfied. (256-
2024)

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) As the local governing body responsible for the approval of
subdivision plats within its rural jurisdiction, the Scott County Board of Supervisors has
on this 21st day of November, 2024, considered the final plat of THE RESERVE. Said
plat is a subdivision in Parts of the NE V4 of Section 7 and NW V4 of Section 8 of
Pleasant Valley Township in Scott County, lowa, and having found the same made in
substantial accordance with the provisions of Chapter 354, Code of lowa, and the Scott
County Subdivision Ordinance, does hereby approve the final plat of said subdivision. 2)
The Board Chairman is authorized to sign the Certificate of Approval on behalf of the
Board of Supervisors and the County Auditor to attest to his signature. 3) This
Resolution shall take effect upon confirmation from the Planning and Development
Director to the Chairman of the Board of Supervisors that the three conditions of
approval recommended by the Planning and Zoning Commission have been satisfied.
(257-2024)

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) The authority of the Director of Information Technology to sign
the five-year agreement with Patagonia Health in an amount not to exceed $150,336.55
for electronic health records software is hereby approved. 2) This resolution shall take
effect immediately. (258-2024)

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) The hiring of Cathy Dunklin for the position of Detention Youth
Counselor with the YJRC Department starting at entry level rate. 2) The hiring of Max
Meidinger for the position of EMT with the Medic Department starting at entry level rate.
3) The hiring of Cali Wilson for the position of Paramedic with the Medic Department
starting at entry level rate. 4) The hiring of Cole Stineman for the position of Bailiff with
the Sheriff's Office starting at entry level rate. (259-2024)

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) The 2023 property taxes due in September 2024 and March 2025
for Barbara Slifka, 2501 E 34" Street Ct, Davenport, lowa in the amount of $2,148.00
including interest are hereby suspended. 2) The County Treasurer is hereby directed to
suspend the collection of the above stated taxes and utility fees thereby establishing a
lien on said property as required by law with future collection to include statutory
interest, if any. 3) This resolution shall take effect immediately. (260-2024)

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) The 2023 property taxes due in September 2024 and March 2025
for John and Pamela Jones, 124 South 9th Street, LeClaire, lowa in the amount of
$2,755.00 including interest are hereby suspended. 2) The County Treasurer is hereby
directed to suspend the collection of the above stated taxes and utility fees thereby



establishing a lien on said property as required by law with future collection to include
statutory interest, if any. 3) This resolution shall take effect immediately. (261-2024)

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) A total of 17 applications, covering 2,292.81 acres were received
in the Davenport City Assessor’s office. All applications meet the eligibility requirements
of lowa Code Section 425A and are recommended for approval by the Davenport City
Assessor’s office. The following 6 applications covering 882.23 acres are recommended
for disallowance by the Davenport City Assessor’s office due to reasons listed:

2024 DAVENPORT - DISALLOWED FAMILY FARM TAX CREDIT

NAME & ADDRESS PARCEL ID ACRES REASON
Did Not Return New Mailed
T1835-03 40.00 Application
Marla J Dexter
Revocable Trust T1837-08 40.00 Marla J Dexter Died 2-22-2024
1720 Wisconsin Street T1839-07 6.95 Dale died 4-24-2022
2001 App says Dale & Marla
Leclaire IA 52753 T1851-01 40.00 Farmed
T1853-06 39.20
U1801-01B 27.57
u1817-02 39.00
U1819-03 25.00
U1821-06 21.30
U1823-03 1.320
280.34
Has Tenant Farmer - Does not
Y0401-01 27.10 farm per owner
Y0417-18 19.75
Glen A & Kathleen A
Moeller Y0433-17F 7.92
28140 162nd Ave Y0507-25 12.40
Long Grove IA 52756  Y0523-22 27.46
Y0539-16 6.10
100.73
Shirley Jean Perry Y3337-04A 6.00 Rents to Neighbor Rick Mess
20739 210th Street Y3339-05A 10.21
Bettendorf |1A 52722 16.21
Thomsen Family Did Not Return New Mailed
Farm Corp V0101-02 28.30 Application
Gary Robert Meinke died 5-6-
2590 230th Street V0103-01A 25.90 2022 &
Walcott |IA 52773 V0105-03 4.60 listed as farmer
58.80
Did Not Return New Mailed
V3135-01 24.00 Application



Three JPLLC V3137-03 22.00 Allen E Plambeck died 1-29-2013

4008 W 30th Street V3139-06 14.50 Glady Plambeck died 1-17-2011
2001 App listed Allen & Gladys

Davenport lowa 52804 V3151-02 40.00 as farming

V3153-04 40.00

V3155-06 32.90

V3233-11 11.75

V3235-10 3.00

V3249-08 29.35

V3251-09 30.00

247.50
Responded by Phone - Does not

Y0505-37 29.40 Farm
Watkins Partnership
LLC Y0507-22 25.00
3764 275th Street Y0521-35 19.50
Camanche lowa
52730 Y0521-36A 14.25

Y0523-21C 7.50

Y3237-05 23.00

Y3253-08 40.00

Y3255-09 20.00

178.65

6 APPLICATIONS Total Acres 882.23
2) This resolution shall take effect immediately. (262-2024)

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) A total of 44 applications were received in the Scott County
Assessor’s office. Of those, 43 applications are recommended for approval, covering
3,343.28 total acres.The following 1 application covering 54.90 acres are recommended
for disallowance by the Scott County Assessor’s office due to reasons listed:

| 2024 COUNTY - DISALLOWED FAMILY FARM TAX CREDIT
NAME & ADDRESS PARCELID CITY/TOWNSHIP ACRES REASON
i FAMILY NO LONGER FARMING;
SHIRLEY JEAN PERRY 943305001 LINCOLN TWP 28.00 LEASED TO NEIGHBOR
20739 210TH ST 943323003 13.62
BETTENDORF, IA 52722 '943307003 13.28
1 APPLICATION TOTAL ACRES 54.90

2) This resolution shall take effect immediately. (263-2024)

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) That the following appointments for a two (2) year term expiring
on December 31, 2026 are hereby approved: Dr. Barbara Harre, County Medical
Examiner, Dr. Richard Blunk, Deputy County Medical Examiner, Dr. William Jerome,
Deputy County Medical Examiner, Donald Schaeffer, County Lead Medical Examiner
Investigator (CME-I), James Gibney, County Medical Examiner Investigator (CME-I),



Holly Kay, County Medical Examiner Investigator (CME-I), Todd Malone, County
Medical Examiner Investigator (CME-I), Carey Sodawasser, County Medical Examiner
Investigator (CME-I). 2) This resolution shall take effect immediately. (264-2024)

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) The Scott County Board of Supervisors approves for payment

all warrants numbered 335937 through 336230 as submitted and prepared for payment
by the County Auditor, in the total amount of $2,274,866.01. 2) The Scott County Board
of Supervisors approves for payment all EFT payments as submitted and prepared for
payment by the County Auditor, in the total amount of $2,284.04. 3) The Board of
Supervisors approves for payment to Wells Fargo Bank all purchase card program
transactions as submitted to the County Auditor for review in the amount of
$157,959.28. 4) This resolution shall take effect immediately. (265-2024)

Moved by Dickson, seconded by Maxwell that the following resolution (266-2024)
be approved. Roll Call: All Ayes.

BE IT RESOLVED: 1) In accordance with Scott County General Policy 19 “Tax Deed
Disposal and Auction Policy” as adopted on April 11, 2024, the Board of Supervisors is
authorized to set the date of a live public auction, the minimum bid for that auction, and
the minimum bid for an online auction for any parcels not sold at the live public auction.
2) The live auction, held August 28, 2024, resulted in fifty-five of sixty-one parcels being
sold. 3) The Board of Supervisors hereby designates Wednesday, November 27, 2024,
12:00 P.M. through Friday December 20, 2024, 11:59 A.M. as the timeframe for the
online auction. The auction will occur online at https://www.publicsurplus.com/. 4) The
Board of Supervisors hereby declares the minimum bid amount for the online auction is
$100; 5) Six (6) properties are to be auctioned, as seen in Exhibit A. 6) This resolution
shall take effect immediately.

Planning and Development Director Greg Schaapveld reviewed there has been no
public input regarding the Ordinance.

Moved by Dickson, seconded by Maxwell a motion to suspend the rules to waive
the third reading to amend the Scott County Code of Ordinances — Construction Codes
— Chapter 5 to repeal and then adopt all New Sections 5-1 through 5-6 and 5-9 through
5-12. Roll Call: All Ayes.

Moved by Dickson, seconded by Maxwell a motion to waive the third reading to
amend the Scott County Code of Ordinances — Construction Codes — Chapter 5 to
repeal and then adopt all New Sections 5-1 through 5-6 and 5-9 through 5-12. Roll Call:
All Ayes.

Moved by Dickson, seconded by Maxwell a motion to approve the second and
final reading to amend the Scott County Code of Ordinances — Construction Codes —
Chapter 5 to repeal and then adopt all New Sections 5-1 through 5-6 and 5-9 through 5-
12. Roll Call: All Ayes.



AN ORDINANCE TO ADOPT AMENDMENTS TO CHAPTER 5 OF THE SCOTT
COUNTY CODE TO ADD AND AMEND CERTAIN CONSTRUCTION CODE
REQUIREMENTS FOR NON-AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS CONSTRUCTED IN
UNINCORPORATED SCOTT COUNTY.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF SCOTT COUNTY, IOWA:

Section 1. Repeal all of sections 5-1 through 5-6 and 5-9 through 5-12 of Chapter 5,
SCOTT COUNTY CODE.

Section 2. Adopt new Sections 5-1 through 5-6 and 5-9 through 5-12 of Chapter 5,
SCOTT COUNTY CODE, which reads as follows:

SECTION 5-1 TITLE & ADOPTION
A. This Chapter shall be known and referred to collectively as the “Scott County
Construction Codes.”
B. This chapter shall take effect and be in force, from and after its approval and
publishing as required by law, with an enforcement date of January 1st, 2025.

SECTION 5-2 SCOPE

A. All buildings shall be required to comply with the Scott County Construction
Codes in force at the time the building permit was issued, and the County
retains the right to prosecute owners of buildings for County violations under
those codes, even if the codes are amended or replaced by newer versions.

B. Remodeling or reconstruction of structures regulated by this Chapter shall
comply with the codes as prescribed herein.

C. Not withstanding the foregoing, structures in existence at the time of the
adoption of this Chapter may have their existing use or occupancy continued, if
such use or occupancy complies with the provisions of the Scott County
Construction Codes in effect when initiated, provided however that such
continued use is not determined to be dangerous to health, life and safety.

SECTION 5-3 LIMITATIONS

This Ordinance shall not apply within the incorporated area of a City except at the
option of the City and in accordance with an agreement with the County. Also, except to
the extent required to implement Section 6.21 through 6-24 of the Scott County Code
(“General Provisions of the Floodplain Districts,” ““FW” Floodway Overlay District,” ““FF”
Floodway Fringe Overlay District,” and ““GF” General Flood Plain Overlay District”), no
provisions of this Chapter shall be construed to apply to farm houses, farm barns, farm
outbuildings, or other buildings or structures which are primarily adapted, by reason of
nature and area for use for agricultural purposes as defined by Section 6-4 of the Scott
County Code (“Farm Exemptions”). It shall be the responsibility of any person or group
claiming that certain property is entitled to exemption on the basis of this Section to
demonstrate that the property and buildings are primarily adapted and used for
agricultural purposes by a farmer.



SECTION 5-4 ADOPTION OF CONSTRUCTION CODES
A. The following codes, and their related codes as referenced, are hereby
adopted in full except for such portions as may be deleted, modified or
amended, and all subsequent supplements to the below mentioned codes as
published:

International Building Code 2021 Edition (IBC)

International Energy Conservation Code 2015 Edition (IECC)

International Existing Building Code 2021 Edition (IEBC)

International Residential Code Edition 2021 (IRC)

International Mechanical Code 2021 Edition, as adopted by the State

of lowa (IMC)

. International Property Maintenance Code 2021 Edition (IPMC)

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 2021 Edition (ISPSC)

8. National Electrical Code 2020 Edition, as adopted by the State of lowa
(NEC)

9. Uniform Plumbing Code 2021 Edition, as adopted by the State of lowa
(UPC)

B. An official copy of all referenced books is on file in the Scott County Planning
and Development Office for public inspections, and copies thereof are for sale
at the cost to the public.

C. If any conflict exists between the adopted International Codes, Uniform
Codes, National Codes, State Code, and other County Ordinances, the more
restrictive code requirement applies.

aRWON=

~N o

SECTION 5-5 AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
The following amendments, modifications, additions and deletions to the International
Building Code 2021 Edition are hereby made:

A. Section 101.1: Insert Scott County as the [NAME OF JURISDICTION].

B. Delete all references to the International Fire Code.

C. Section 101.4.3: Replace the International Plumbing Code with

Uniform Plumbing Code
D. Section 101.4.3: Replace the International Private Sewage Disposal Code
with Scott County Code Chapter 33 “Private Sewage Disposal Systems.”

E. Section 103.1: Insert Planning and Development Department as [NAME
OF DEPARTMENT]
Section 105.2(2) Building: Replace 7’ with 6'.
Section 105.2(6) Building: Delete in its entirety.
Section 105.5: Replace with the following: Every permit issued shall
become invalid unless the work authorized by such permit is commenced
within 180 days after its issuance date, or if the work authorized by such
permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time
the work is commenced. All permits shall expire 12 months from the date
of issue, unless an extensions has been issued by the building official.
The building official is authorized to issue extensions of 180 days for one
half the original permit fee, or a set fee determined by the building official
on the work left to be completed.

R oRe



L.

=

2

Section 1612.3: Insert Scott County, lowa and Unincorporated Areas as
[NAME OF JURISDICTION].

Section 1612.3: Insert March 23, 2021 as [DATE OF ISSUANCE].
Section 1807.3: Add paragraph: All building or portions of buildings
containing mechanical systems and/or connected to underground water
service, sanitary/septic sewer service, and/or storm sewer service shall be
supported on a continuous perimeter frost-free foundation to a minimum
depth of 42 inches below finished grade. Buildings connected to only
underground electric service and/or floor drains that discharge directly to
grade are exempt from this requirement.

Appendices: Delete all appendices

All references to the building line and zoning are void, and the subject
matter of Scott County Code Chapter 6 “Zoning for Unincorporated
Areas” shall be applicable in unincorporated areas, and the subject matter
of a municipality’s zoning ordinance shall be applicable within the
corporate limits of that municipality.

SECTION 5-6 AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE
The following amendments, modifications, additions and deletions to the International
Residential Code 2021 are hereby made:

A. Section R101.1: Insert Scott County as the [NAME OF JURISDICTION].

B. Section R103: Delete in its entirety

C. Section R105.2(1): Delete in its entirety and replace with the following:

Section R105.2(1): One-story detached accessory structures, provided the floor area
does not exceed 120 square feet.

D. Section R105.2(5): Delete in its entirety.

E. Section R105.5: Replace with the following: Every permit issued shall become
invalid unless the work authorized by such permit is commenced within 180
days after its issuance date, or if the work authorized by such permit is
suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time the work is
commenced. All permits shall expire 12 months from the date of issue, unless
an extensions has been issued by the building official. The building official is
authorized to issue extensions of 180 days for one half the original permit fee,
or a set fee determined by the building official on the work left to be
completed.

F. Table R301.2: The following information is added to Table R301.2:

GROUND
SNOW
LOADe

WIND DESIGN SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM
- SEISMIC
Speed | Topographic Special | Windborne DESIGN Frost
wind debris CATEGORY' | Weathering® | line Termite®
(mph) | Effects region' | zone™ depthb




ps = 30 psf,
except that
calculations
for
additional » Moderate
drift loads 115 Yes No No A Severe 42 to Heavy
shall use a
ground
snow load
pg = 25 psf
ICE BARRIER
UNDERLAMENT FLOOD HAZARDSY mEEEEZ'NG ¥§Gg ANNUAL
REQUIRED"
Initial NFIP 06/01/1977 Community
#190239 Effective FIS 3/23/2021 o
Yes Effective FIRMs 3/23/2021 & 2000 50.5°F
4/11/2024
G. Table R301.2: Delete Manual J Design Criteria in its entirety.
H. Section R302.13: Delete in its entirety.
l.

Section R311.7.8.4: Add Exception #3. Handrails within a dwelling unit or

serving an individual dwelling unit may have 1 offset interruption per flight of

stairs of six inches in total length where a partial wall comes to an endpoint.

J. Section R313.1: Add to the end of the sentence: of 5 or more townhouse
units.

K. Section R313.2: Delete in its entirety.

L. Section R320: Replace in its entirety with lowa Administrative Code 661,

Chapter 302.
M. Table R403.1(1): Replace table with the following table:
Table R403.1
Number Of Thickness Of - - .
Floors Foundation Walls Mllmmum Thickness Minimum Depth of Foundation
Width . Below Natural Surface Of Ground
Supported (Inches) . Of Footing . .
- Footing Or Finish Grade (Whichever Is
by The Unit Mason (Inches) (Inches) Lower) (Inches)
Foundation Concrete Y
1 8 8 16 8 42
2 8 8 16 8 42
3 10 12 18 12 42
1 Foundations may support a roof in addition to the stipulated number of floors.

Foundations supporting roofs only shall be as required for supporting one floor.
Footings shall be continuous and contain a minimum of two 1/2" reinforcement bars and
have a minimum compressive strength of 2,500 pounds per square inch at 28 days.

2 A one-story wood frame building used for private garage, detached accessory to
a single-family dwelling and not over 720 square feet in floor area may be constructed
on a floating slab-on-grade provided the following conditions are met: A concrete
perimeter grade-beam, twelve inches deep and twelve inches wide and reinforced with
two 1/2" reinforcement bars shall be installed to support the exterior walls. A minimum



four-inch-thick concrete floor slab reinforced with wire mesh or fiber mesh shall be
installed within the perimeter beam and shall be formed to allow a continuous pour
consisting of the required grade beam and floor.

3 Buildings or portions of buildings containing mechanical systems and/or
connected to underground water service, sanitary/septic sewer service, and/or storm
sewer service shall be supported on a continuous, frost- free foundation capable of
resisting the movement of the slab-on-grade. Buildings connected to only underground
electric service and/or floor drains that discharge directly to grade are exempt from this
requirement.

4 Cast-in-place concrete foundations walls shall be concrete having a minimum
compressive strength of 28 days of not less than 3,000 pounds per square inch. In
addition, the following shall apply:

(a) The minimum thickness of a wall shall be 71/2 inches.

(b) Walls shall be reinforced with no less than three half-inch diameter preformed ASTM
A615 grade 40 steel bars placed horizontally at the center of the wall, with one bar
located near the top, one bar located near the bottom, and one bar located near mid-
height of the wall.

N. R506.2.3: Replace “10-mil (0.010inch; 0.254 mm)” with “6-mil (0.006 inch;
152uM).”

O. Table R507.3.1: Delete table in its entirety and replace with “Deck and
Addition Footing Requirements.”

“All decks without roof support shall have a minimum footing size of 12” in diameter and
42” in depth.”

“All decks and additions (screened porches, 3 seasons rooms, 4 seasons rooms, etc)
with roof support shall have one of the following.

1 Pier footings designed by a professional engineer.
2 12” wide trench footing 42” in depth extended out 12” past point load
3 Spread footings 42” in depth with a minimum 8” masonry wall or concrete

foundation wall.
“Deck Post Height Requirements.”
Deck Post Size Maximum Height

4 x4 8’-0”
4x6 8’-0”
6x6 14’ -0”

Measured to the underside of the beam.
P. R403.1.1: Add:
Exception 1. Deck footings not supporting a roof or overhead structure may be a
minimum 12 inches in diameter and 42 inches below finished grade.
Exception 2. All covered decks, screened porches, three season rooms, four season
rooms, room additions and similar structures shall be supported on foundations
compliant with Table R403.1(1) or conforming to one of the following methods:
1. Pier footings designed and stamped by a design professional.
2. 12 inch wide reinforced trench footing 42 inches in depth.



3. 16” wide spread footings 42 inches in depth with a minimum 8 inch masonry or
concrete foundation wall as per Figure 403.1.1.

Q. Chapter 11: Delete in its entirety and replace with:
Chapter 11 “Energy Efficiency”
The 2015 International Energy Conservation Code, Residential Provisions as amended
in Scott County Code Chapter 5 “Construction Codes,” shall apply.

R. Chapters 25-32: Delete in their entirety and replace all references to these
chapters with the lowa State Plumbing Code.

S. All references to the building line and zoning are void, and the subject matter
of Scott County Code Chapter 6 “Zoning for Unincorporated Areas” shall be
applicable in unincorporated areas, and the subject matter of a municipality’s
zoning ordinance shall be applicable within the corporate limits of that
municipality.

SECTION 5-9 AMENDMENTS TO THE UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
RESERVED

SECTION 5-10 AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE
RESERVED

SECTION 5-11 AMENDMENTS TO THE NATIONAL ELECTRIC CODE
RESERVED

SECTION 5-12 AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL POOL AND SPA CODE
The following amendments, modifications, additions and deletions to the International
Swimming Pool and Spa Code 2021 are hereby made:

A. Section 101.1: Insert Scott County as the [NAME OF JURISDICTION].

B. Section 101.2: Add Exception: Residential, on ground pools supplied by a
single pool manufacturer as a kit that includes a pump and motor that is
double insulated with a factory installed 25 foot GFCI protected cord shall
be installed per the manufactures installation instructions and meet the
barrier requirements of Chapter 3. It shall be the owners/installers
responsibility to ensure ongoing compliance with the installation for
access, barrier and signage.

C. Section 103.1: Insert Planning and Development Department as [NAME
OF DEPARTMENT]

D. Section 105.3: Replace with the following: Every permit issued shall
become invalid unless the work authorized by such permit is commenced
within 180 days after its issuance date, or if the work authorized by such
permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time
the work is commenced. All permits shall expire 12 months from the date
of issue, unless an extensions has been issued by the building official.
The building official is authorized to issue extensions of 180 days for one
half the original permit fee, or a set fee determined by the building official
on the work left to be completed.



E. Section 112.1: Delete in its entirety and replace with R112.3
Qualifications (from the 2021 IRC)

Section 113.4 Delete in its entirety and replace with 114.4 Violation
penalties (from the 2021 IBC).

Section 303: Delete in its entirety.

Section 304: Delete in its entirety and replace with reference to the Scott
County Zoning Ordinance.

Section 811.1: Delete in its entirety.

™

T Q

=

Section 3. Validity and Severability

Should any section or provision of this Ordinance be declared by a court of competent
jurisdiction to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the Ordinance as a
whole, or any part thereof other than the part so declared to be invalid.

Section 4. Repealer

All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are
hereby repealed.

Section 5. Effective Date.

This ordinance shall be in full force and effective January 1, 2025 upon its final passage
and publication as by law provided.
First Consideration _ November 7, 2024 ,
Second Consideration November 21, 2024 ,
Third Consideration Waived

Budget and Administrative Services Director David Farmer presented Financial Updates
including a monthly dashboard. He included current County revenues and expenditures,
economic impacts, and fund balance. He also presented GEMT funding updates for
MEDIC.

County Administrator Mahesh Sharma spoke on monthly and quarterly financial
updates, ARPA projects including Parkview and Conservation, and a Department Head
meeting.

Supervisor Dickson spoke on Workforce Development, an RDA grants meeting, and a
group attending the public hearing of the Racing and Gaming Commission for a land-
based casino in Cedar Rapids.

Supervisor Maxwell spoke on the EMA search for an Assistant Director and Bi-State
regarding passenger rail service still many years away.

Supervisor Beck spoke on the Veterans Day Arsenal service, GDRC, Scott County
Waste Commission municipal waste up this year and starting another cell next year. He



also reviewed Bi-State and the metropolitan planning area including Federal grant
funding. He also reviewed SCRA grants and Ports of Eastern lowa still working on by-

laws.

Moved by Paustian, seconded by Bribriesco at 6:20 p.m. a motion to adjourn. All
Ayes.

Ken Beck, Chair of the Board
Scott County Board of Supervisors

ATTEST: Kerri Tompkins
Scott County Auditor

A video recording of the meeting is available on the Scott County website at:
https://www.scottcountyiowa.gov/board/board-meetings.



